MARSHALL COUNTY COMMISSION

424 BLOUNT AVENUE

GUNTERSVILLE AL 35976

BID TABULATION FOR BID #26-25

FULL DEPTH RECLAMATION (COMPLETE IN-PLACE) COUNTYWIDE

BID OPENING DATE: 2:00 PM SEPTEMBER 16, 2025

Countywide
VENDOR BID PRICES
1. 2. 3. 4. S.
3024-000 302B-000 4014-000 4014-006
Full Depth Portland Full Depth 8" Bituminous Bituminous
Reclamation 8" Cement for Full Thick without Treatment A Treatment G
Thick Per SY Depth Cement Cf)""ty Per SY Per SY
Reclamation Limif:zzlj::fad of
Per TON mix Per SY
Blount Construction
Company Inc. 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 100-300 Tons 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Mariett, GA 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 301-500 Tons 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
30,001-40,000 Square Yard 501-700 Tons 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
40,001-50,000 Square Yard 701-900 tons 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
50,001 Square Yards & Above 901 Tons & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Central Alabama Asphalt
& Construction $5.00 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $235.00 100-300 Tons $5.00 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $2.50 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $5.50 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Tuscaloosa, AL $4.25 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $225.00 301-500 Tons $4.50 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $1.50 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $4.25 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$4.00 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $220.00 501-700 Tons $4.25 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $1.50 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $4.00 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$4.00 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $220.00 701-900 tons $4.25 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $1.50 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $3.75 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$4.00 50,001 Square Yards & Above $220.00  |901 Tons & Above $4.25 50,001 Square Yards & Above $1.50 50,001 Square Yards & Above $3.75 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Chilton Contractors Inc. $4.76 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $258.68 100-300 Tons $4.76 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $2.92 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $4.17 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Clanton, AL $4.31 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $258.68 301-500 Tons $4.31 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $2.68 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $3.66 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$4.14 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $258.68 501-700 Tons $4.14 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $2.60 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $3.49 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$4.05 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $258.68 701-900 tons $4.05 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $2.56 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $3.41 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$4.05 50,001 Square Yards & Above $258.68 |901 Tons & Above $4.05 50,001 Square Yards & Above $2.53 50,001 Square Yards & Above $3.36 50,001 Square Yards & Above
D&J Construction 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 100-300 Tons 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Auburn, AL 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 301-500 Tons 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
30,001-40,000 Square Yard 501-700 Tons 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
40,001-50,000 Square Yard 701-900 tons 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
50,001 Square Yards & Above 901 Tons & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Road Worx Inc. $5.35 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $230.00 100-300 Tons $5.20 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $2.30 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $6.37 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Knoxville, TN $4.98 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $230.00 301-500 Tons $4.80 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $2.25 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $3.70 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$4.66 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $230.00 501-700 Tons $4.40 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $2.20 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $3.18 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$4.40 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $230.00 701-900 tons $4.15 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $2.15 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $2.90 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$4.25 50,001 Square Yards & Above $230.00 {901 Tons & Above $4.00 50,001 Square Yards & Above $2.10 50,001 Square Yards & Above $2.88 50,001 Square Yards & Above




Countywide

VENDOR BID PRICES
6. 7. 8. 9.
4014-008 4014-009 409A4-001 433A4-000
Bituminous Bituminous Triple Layer Scrub Seal
Treatment J Per Treatment K Bituminous
SY Per SY Treatment Per
SY
Blount Construction 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Mariett, GA 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Central Alabama Asphalt $6.00 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $6.00 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $10.00 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $5.50 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Tuscaloosa, AL $4.65 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $4.65 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $8.85 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $3.65 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$4.35 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $4.35 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $7.85 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $3.00 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$4.15 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $4.15 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $7.25 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $3.00 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$4.15 50,001 Square Yards & Above $4.15 50,001 Square Yards & Above $7.00 50,001 Square Yards & Above $3.00 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Chilton Contractors Inc. $4.58 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $5.51 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $8.97 10,000-20,000 Square Yard No Bid 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Clanton, AL $4.18 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $5.01 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $8.46 20,001-30,000 Square Yard No Bid 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$4.01 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $4.84 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $8.29 30,001-40,000 Square Yard No Bid 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$3.93 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $4.76 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $8.21 40,001-50,000 Square Yard No Bid 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$3.88 50,001 Square Yards & Above $4.71 50,001 Square Yards & Above $8.16 50,001 Square Yards & Above No Bid 50,001 Square Yards & Above
D&J Construction 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Auburn, AL 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above 50,001 Square Yards & Above
Road Worx Inc. $5.26 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $5.50 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $7.05 10,000-20,000 Square Yard $5.25 10,000-20,000 Square Yard
Knoxville, TN $4.05 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $4.30 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $5.90 20,001-30,000 Square Yard $4.05 20,001-30,000 Square Yard
$3.56 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $3.78 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $5.40 30,001-40,000 Square Yard $3.56 30,001-40,000 Square Yard
$3.28 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $3.50 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $5.10 40,001-50,000 Square Yard $3.28 40,001-50,000 Square Yard
$3.25 50,001 Square Yards & Above $3.48 50,001 Square Yards & Above $5.05 50,001 Square Yards & Above $3.25 50,001 Square Yards & Above

Awarded 9/24/2025




